
 

 

Assistant National Showcase Production Coordinator  
The Assistant National Showcase Production Coordinator facilitates the presentation of the 
showcases at NACA Live and the support of the showcase production at the NACA conferences as 
needed. 
 
Specific Responsibilities: 

• Assist with the review of Showcase policies annually. 

• Assists with the preparation of the production binder with all performing artists’ letters of intent, 
stage plots, etc as needed by the National Showcase Production Coordinator.  

• Assists with the coordination of all stage plots and A/V/tech needs (LCD projectors, etc.) with 
the National Showcase Production Team, sound and light company, and NACA Office as 
needed by the National Showcase Production Coordinator. 

• Assists the National Showcase Production Coordinator with the presentation of the showcases 
at NACA Live (as per printed policy). 

• Assists with the direct load-in, load-out, sound and light checks, and performances per 
standard production schedule provided by NACA® Office.  

• Assists with the supervision of the volunteer Stage Crew in collaboration with National 
Showcase Production Coordinator and the contracted sound and light company. 

• Attend monthly calls with National Showcase Production Team, Regional Showcase 
Production Coordinators, and the NACA Office.  

• Support the National Production Coordinator in the development and facilitation of trainings 
offered to Regional Showcase Production coordinators on all showcase policies and 
procedures. 

• Relay and follow up on all communications with the regional coordinators including deadlines, 
policy updates, resources, etc. 

• Attend NACA conferences and support the Regional Showcase Production Coordinator with 
the load-in, load-out, sound checks, and performances as needed.  

• Additional responsibilities as assigned and agreed upon with volunteer supervisor and/or 
NACA office staff liaison. 

 
Qualifications/Expectations: 

• The Assistant National Showcase Production Coordinator must not be a current or former 
employee or intern of an NACA® associate member firm or agency, or plan to be employed by 
or be an intern for an NACA® associate member firm or agency within the next NACA® fiscal 
year. 

• The Assistant National Showcase Production Coordinator should be available during the week 
immediately following the Showcase Selection Committee meeting to complete showcase 
production scheduling and communication to the NACA® Office. 

• Supports NACA programs through attendance whenever possible. 

• Must be a full-time professional staff member at an NACA member institution. 

• Must have approval from and support of their institution (note: support is defined as financial 
as well as time out of the office, etc.). 



• If the volunteer changes jobs during the position’s term, the new school must also be a NACA 
member and provide a statement of support. The NACA Volunteer Development Manager 
must be informed of this change within two weeks and the new letter of support must be 
received at the NACA Office within 30 days of selection. If not a member school, the school 
must join as a member within 30 days of hiring. 
 

 Association Support:  

• Registration waiver, hotel rooms, travel, meals and/or per diems will be provided for NACA® 
Live and NACA conferences if required to attend. 

• NACA Connect 

• Zoom 

• NACA Google Drives 
 
Term of Service/Time Commitment: 

• One Year 

• May 1 – April 30 

• NACA® Live: February (dates vary each year) 

• NACA Conferences: Attending 2-3 conferences as needed. Sept – November  
 
NACA Office Liaisons:  

• Experience & Events Director 
 
Competencies: 

• Relationship Development 

• Networking and Business Relationships  

• Professional Development 

• Policy Knowledge, Development & Management 

• Training 

• Volunteer and Staff Management 

• Supervising 

• Event Support 

• Intentionality in Student Learning 

• Fiscal Management 


